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Importance: High
Hi Yu Zhen

We engaged UOB TP for his travel airfare.

Please see the PR raised by Margaret in the email attached.

Thank you.

Chew Jian Yue
Executive | Student SUcceSS Centre

e Uni' ity of Social
463 Clementi Road, Singapore 599494
t +65 6240 8954 | suss.edu.sg

Privileged / Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, nor

disclose its c

ontents to any other person. Please notify the sender immediately if you have received this in error.

From: Ng Yu Zhen (SUSS) <yzng@suss.edu.sg>

Sent: Tu

esday, October 24, 2023 2:05 PM

To: Chew Jian Yue (SUSS) <jychew@suss.edu.sg>
Cc: Chew Wee Ling (SUSS) <wlchew@suss.edu.sg>

Subject:

RE: Honorarium Payments to Roger Slee

Hi Jian Yue,

Noted on the speaker fee as for the airfare is there any reimbursement to him?

Regards,
Yu zhen

From: Chew Jian Yue (SUSS) <jychew@suss.edu.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, October 24, 2023 1:57 PM

To: Ng Yu Zhen (SUSS) <yzng@suss.edu.sg>

Cc: Chew Wee Ling (SUSS) <wlchew@suss.edu.sg>

Subject:

RE: Honorarium Payments to Roger Slee

Importance: High

Hi Yu Zhen

We only pay for 0.5 days for our workshop speaker fees, as per SSC'’s total engagement with Roger. | have informed EL side to pay the amount for the time they engaged

services

with Roger Slee.

Thank you.

Chew Jian Yue
Executive | Student SUcceSS Centre

e Uni ity of Social
463 Clementi Road, Singapore 599494
t +65 6240 8954 | suss.edu.sg

Privileged / Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, nor

disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender immediately if you have received this in error.

From: Ng Yu Zhen (SUSS) <yzn uss.edu.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, October 24, 2023 1:55 PM
To: Chew Jian Yue (SUSS) <jychew@suss.edu.sg>

Subject:

FW: Honorarium Payments to Roger Slee

Importance: High

Hi Jian Yue,

Any airfare reimbursement to speaker?

Meanwhile, can | confirm the honorarium amount should be $2,500 or $1,500?

PR Mumber [Material [Short Text Line ltem Descr. Quantity  [Unit of UnitPrice  |Line flem  [Curren
Measure Value in
Ori. Doc.

- - - - - - - |Cur -
7000007789 K40354  Coach/Speaker/Facilitator/ Orangiser Fee Honorarium for keynote speaker for AEE Conference 2023 1.000 EA 1,000.00 1,000.00 SGD
(7000007789 K40351 Coach/Speaker/Facilitator/ Orangiser Fee Inclusive Practices Workshop with Roger Slee 1.000 EA 500.00 500.00 SGD
(7000007789 K40436  HotelOther Accommadation Allowance of $250 per night hotel accommaodation of 7 nig 7.000 EA 250.00 1,750.00 SGD

1.

Bw

Annex A

SUSS will provide the following:

Round-trip economy class air ticket based on the most economical (and direct) route between
the country/state of residence and Singapore.

Allowance of $250 per night hotel accommodation of 7 nights in Singapore for the duration of
the Conference and training period.

An honorarium of S51,000 for the engagement at the Conference.

An honorarium of §$1,500 for the 1.5 days professional development training for SUSS
staff/faculty.
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Number |Material | Short Text |Line ltem Descr. |Quantity [Unitol —|UnitPrice  |Lineltem | Current
IMeasure. Value in
lori. Doc.

5 5 > > ~ | -
7000007789 K40354  CoachiSpeaker/Faciltatorl Orangiser Fee Honorarium for keynote speaker for AEE Conference 2023 1.000 EA ,000.00 1,000.00 SGD
7000007789 K40351  CoachiSpeakerfFacilitator/ Orangiser Fee Inclusive Practices Workshop with Roger Slee 1.000 EA 50000  500.00 SGD
7000007789 K40436  Hotel/Other Accommodation Allowance of $250 per night hotel accommodation of 7nig  7.000 EA 25000 1,750.00 SGD





Annex A

SUSS will provide the following:

1. i sconoy o ek b n i mostconania(an e st
e country/ nce and Singapor

2. Allowance of ht hotel accommodation of 7 nights in Singapore for the duration of
the Conference period.

3. An honorarium of ‘engagement at the Conference.

4. An honorarium the 1.5 days professional development training for SUSS

staff/faculty.









Hi Account Payable team,




 




Please refer to the SAP documents for payment processing. 






 










			

Supplier






			

PR No.






			

Description






			

Amount (SGD)













			

UOB TRAVEL PLANNERS PTE LTD






			

3000005002






			

Invoice No.: IV855056


Itin: MAN/DXB/SIN/DXB/MAN


Detail: EK20 - ECONOMY CLASS - 09/06/23


PAX: SLEE/ROGER CLEMENT MR






			

1,718.90













			

UOB TRAVEL PLANNERS PTE LTD






			

3000005002






			

Invoice No.: IV855056


Transaction Fee






			

14.00


















 




Thank you.




 




 










			

Best regards,




Margaret Lee


Student Associate, Finance and Administration l  Student SUcceSS Centre
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Singapore University of Social Sciences




463 Clementi Road, Singapore 599494






suss.edu.sg













			

 













			




Privileged / Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, nor

 disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender immediately if you have received this in error.
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SINGAPORE UNIVERSITY
OF SOCIAL SCIENCES




















# UOB Travel

UOBE TRAVEL PLAMMERS PTE LTD

480 Lorong 6 Toa Payoh Unit #20-01 HDB Hub East Wing, Singapore 310480

Tel: (65) 6252 2322 Fax: (65) 6252 9188

TA: 0085 Company Reg. Mo 197400040W Q5T Reg. Mo.: M2-0017651-8
T A X I NV OICE
TO SINGAPORE UNIVERSITY OF SOCIAL SCIENCES TAX INVOICE I1v855056
463 CLEMENTI ROAD DATE 15/05/2023
SINGAPORE 599594 ORDER NO
CONSULTANT CHRISTINE KONG
TEAM TKT - AM
HD ID HID853363
ATTN: CHEW WEE LING MS TERM 45 days
DUE DATE 29/06/2023
*DEPT STUDENT SUCCES *COST CTR: UC1009-STUDE
*EMPLY ID GUEST *PURPOSE AEE CONFERENCE *TRIP PUR: FDS TRAVEL FOR
Ref/Type Description Total
-> Air Ticket Itin MAN/DXB/SIN/DXB/MAN 1,718.90
(2522111) Detail: EK20 - ECONOMY CLASS - 09/06/23
Air ticket details -- (PNR:4GCFLC)
PAX 1. SLEE/ROGER CLEMENT MR ATIRFARE: 852.00
TKT: 176 972-756-5582 TAX: 866.90
ITIN EK0020 09/06/23 MANCHESTER-DUBAI L HK 21:15 07:25
EK0352 10/06/23 DUBAI-SINGAPORE L HK 09:40 21:15
EK0355 17/06/23 SINGAPORE-DUBAI B HK 21:40 00:50
EK0021 18/06/23 DUBAI-MANCHESTER B HK 03:00 07:45
Note AIR TICKET TAXES - L7 10.80 OP 8.00 XT 848.10
-> Service Fees Detail: TRANSACTION FEE 14.00
(2522112) Pax : SLEE ROGER CLEMENT MR
Date 09/06/23 GST: 1.12
Service Items Details -
1. AIR TICKET SLEE/ROGER CLEM 9727565582 FEE:14.00 x 1
Sub Total 1,732.90
GST @ 8% ON 14.00 1.12
GST @ 0% ON 1,718.90 0.00
SGD Total Amount 1,734.02

SINGAPORE DOLLAR ONE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED THIRT

Y FOUR AND TWO CENTS ONLY

Remark ---

1. If Term is CCD or BTA, total amount is charged to credit card, no further
payment required.

2. Cheques should be crossed and made payable to UOB TRAVEL PLANNERS PTE LTD

3. Bank: United Overseas Bank Limited, Bank code: 7375 Branch code: 016
SGD A/C NO. 116-310-461-5 SWIFT CODE: UOVBSGSG

4. Email payment details to UOBTP-Accounts@UOBgroup.com

5. THIS IS A COMPUTER GENERATED DOCUMENT. NO SIGNATURE IS REQUIRED.

16/05/23 09:22 E. & 0.E












Regards,
Yu zhen

From: Chew Jian Yue (SUSS) <jychew@suss.edu.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2023 11:22 AM

To: SUSS Accounts Payable (SUSS) <accountspayable@suss.edu.sg>; Ng Yu Zhen (SUSS) <yzng@suss.edu.sg>
Subject: Honorarium Payments to Roger Slee

Importance: High

Hi Account Payable team,

Please refer to the SAP documents for payment processing.

Supplier PR No. Description Amount (SGD)

Roger Clement | 7000007789/0002 | Inclusive Practices Workshop with Roger Slee (Staff Training) (to 1,500
Slee reclass)
1000017193

Roger Clement 7000007789/0001 Honorarium for keynote speaker for AEE Conference 2023 1,000
Slee
1000017193

Thank you.

Chew Jian Yue
Executive | Student SUcceSS Centre

e Uni ity of Social
463 Clementi Road, Singapore 599494
t +65 6240 8954 | suss.edu.sg

Privileged / Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must ot copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, nor
disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender immediately if you have received this in error.
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